
Maharaja Express - Treasures of India (4
Days/3 Nights)

Note: Price printed on this PDF is valid until 02-05-2025 and is subject to change without notice due to Partner changes and
currency fluctuations

Visit: Delhi - Agra - Ranthambore - Jaipur – Delhi

Detailed Itinerary

Day 01:  Day 01 Sunday Board the Maharajas’ Express in Delhi - Onto Agra

Welcome aboard the Maharajas' Express. Board the train at Delhi in the morning. Arrive Agra, visit the Agra

Fort. Overnight on the train at Agra. Onboard brunch and dinner.

Day 02:  Day 02 Monday Agra - Ranthambore
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Visit the magnificent Taj Mahal followed by breakfast at an exclusive venue. Train proceeds to Sawai

Madhopur. Onboard Lunch followed by Safari in the Ranthambore National Park. Dinner onboard as the

train proceeds to Jaipur.

Day 03:  Day 03 Tuesday Jaipur

After onboard breakfast, deboard to visit the Amber Fort. Lunch onboard. Dinner at an exclusive venue.

Train proceeds to Delhi.

Day 04:  Day 04 Wednesday Delhi

Breakfast onboard as the train arrives into Delhi. Journey ends.

Inclusion
Accommodation in double / twin bedded cabins with en suite bathrooms. All meals, soft beverages, house
brands of Indian wines, beer and spirits Butler service. Guided off train excursions as illustrated in the
journeys inclusive of entrance fees, still camera fee, transport and services of a guide. Complimentary tea,
coffee and mineral water on board. Porterage at stations. Prevailing GST

Exclusion
Any optional tours as mentioned in the itinerary. Insurance, Gratuities. Telephone calls, laundry, alcoholic
beverages (apart from the house brands of wines, spirits, beer served in the restaurants and bar) Video, film
and professional still camera fees. Arrival and departure transfers. International and domestic air tickets. Pre
and post tour accommodation and any tour extensions are not included unless specifically mentioned as part
of the journeys.

Note
Rates are based on Deluxe category cabins twin share Upgrade to Higher categories Cabins on request Child
rates available on request Prices are subject to change in case of any change or amendment in the routing or
change in Government taxes Itineraries, destinations, venues and schedules departure are subject to change
without prior notice All the prices are on per person per journey on twin sharing basis Supplement will apply
for Signature Journey, Special occasions such as a New Year, Christmas etc. There will be supplement per
person extra on Christmas & New Year departures - Price on Request CHILD POLICY Maharajas' Express
does accommodate children but we ask parents to be mindful of the sophisticated adult atmosphere we
endeavour to maintain. Children below 5 years shall be allowed free, subject to sharing of double bed with
parents. This is subject to availability of double bed at the time of booking. Single child (5 years - 12 years) -
50% of the adult fare, subject to sharing of double bed with parents. This is subject to availability of double
bed at the time of booking. Please note that we do not have the facility for interconnecting cabins except in
the Presidential Suite car. All applicable taxes will be charged extra. Maharajas’ Express General Information
On Board the Maharajas’ Express The Maharajas' Express features five carriages for Deluxe Cabins, six for
Junior Suites, two for Suites and one for a grand Presidential Suite. Every cabin has large panoramic
windows - a design marvel, just so, that you can savour every bit of magnificent India. All passenger Cabins
come with individual temperature controls, the first of its kind in India. LCD televisions, DVD players, direct
dial telephone and internet, to name a few. In-house movies and live television also keep you entertained
through the royal journey. Just a small reminder for those who are used to a different power supply, the
Maharajas' Express is equipped with 110/230V sockets. Every cabin also has its own electronic safe deposit
box. General Information Please find below some general information to assist you with your planning for
your journey aboard the Maharajas' Express Maharajas' Dining A royal banquet for royal passengers, the
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Maharajas' Express has two fine dining restaurants that seat 42 persons each and everyone on board dines
together. House wines and beer served whilst dining come complimentary, of course. Maharajas' Bar And
Lounges One exotic Safari bar with the choicest collection of house brands of wines, beer and spirits with
snacks come complimentary to every passenger. There's also a lounge cum bar Rajah Club with comfortable
club arm-chairs. And if these features don't make you feel pampered, the Maharajas' Express also houses a
high-end boutique featuring exquisite and unique creations. Credit Cards The Maharajas' Express accepts
Credit Cards, master, Visa, Amex on board. A surcharge is applicable on all payments made using credit /
debit cards. Maharajas' Transport From super deluxe coaches for Deluxe Cabin and Junior Suite passengers,
to cars for the Suite and Presidential Suite passengers each at every destination. All equipped with
complimentary sightseeing kits like bottle coolers, candies and tissues and shoe uppers. Embarkation &
Disembarkation The point of embarkation and disembarkation for the specific journeys is as follows:
Journeys - Treasures of India Check-in Venue / Time - Safdarjung Railway Station, Delhi / 0800 hrs
Departure Station / Time - Safdarjung Railway Station, Delhi / 0930 hrs Arrival Station / Time - Safdarjung
Railway Station, Delhi / 0800 hrs

Tour Dates & Pricing

Maharaja Express - Treasures of India (4 Days/3 Nights) #959


